
HanamomoNabana no Sato

NGO

D1 NGO APT ~ Shirakawago ~ Takayama ~ Okuhida Onsen

D2 Matsumoto Castle ~ Nakamachi Street ~ Wasabi Farm

D3 Strawberry Picking ~ Hanamomo Festival 

D4 Sakae・Osu ~ Jazz Dream Nagashima ~ Nabanano Sato ~ NGO APT

Matsumoto Castle has an elegant 
structure with black and white, 
designated as one of five castles of 
National Treasure. 
Azumino has the largest production of 
Wasabi cultivating with meltwater of 
Japanese Alps. 

Takayama / Shirakawago

Takayama is known as a little Kyoto, 
which has a very quaint atmosphere. 
Also, Takayama is famous for its 
morning market, one of the three 
biggest morning markets in Japan. 
Shirakawago is the world heritage site 
that is surrounded by mountains and 
maintains its unique and traditional life-
style.

Matsumoto
Please enjoy feeling spring season 
through viewing spring flowers in Japan. 
In April, not only Sakura but also many 
kinds of flowers bloom and tulips will be 
seen in Nabana no Sato. 
Hanamomo (peach tree) also blooms 
around mid-April to early-May at 
Hanamomo no Sato in Achi Village.

Please enjoy 
strawberry picking as 
much as you can eat!


